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The LMI-EUniv project is a 26 months ERASMUS+ 
Strategic Partnership, that brings together 5 partners 
from five EU countries to understand how European 
Universities are using labour market information and 
labour market intelligence in the planning and 
delivery of their training offer and how can this be 
improved  
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WHY IS LMI-EUniv NEEDED? 

LMI is critical for understanding the new challenges on 
the labour market. Having access to a comprehensive 
and detailed view of the labour market on a local, 
regional, national and European level is vital for the 
relevance of their curriculum, the ability to attract 
students, ability to maintain or gain a competitive 
advantage. Up-to-date labour market intelligence is 
also critical to better meet the learning needs of 
students and reduce skills mismatches. 

AIM OF LMI-EUniv 

The ultimate aim of the project is to analyse and under-
stand the use of labour market intelligence in Europe-
an universities, identifying main LMI sources at nation-
al level and creating a collaborative network that pro-
motes teamwork in order to develop a set of tools that 
will help to improve the use of LMI in European univer-
sities. 

OBJECTIVES 

¨ Encourage a greater and more nuanced use of LMI 
within European Universities with a more evidence-
based provision leading to benefits for learners, the 
Universities themselves and the economy and 
societies that benefit from the future efforts of the 
learners/graduates 

¨ Show policymakers and key stakeholders the benefits 
from more closely aligned, better evidenced provision, 
to positively influence university provision 

¨ Widen the appreciation of how LMI can be used both 
within Universities and by those looking to understand 
the importance and potential impacts and benefits 
from Universities  
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For further information please contact: 
lmi-euniv@e-uvt.ro 
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